ol &, €107, -33004/94

REGD NO DI -33004/94

Che Gazette of India

FFTUTIAT
EXTRAORDINARY

wir Il—qvy 3—¥rg-uoy (i)
PART II—Section 3—Suab-section (1)

sThveTe @ STy
PURLISHED BY AUTHORITY

d. 140]
No. 140)

Jq HA™A
=T
a% fesefl, 30 ATH, 1994
at. ®1. f1. 345(%) ~—FFT TORIL, ™AW AT
gfva (fafaew @y faa) sifafas, 1957(1957
®T 67) #1 YT 13 FTT N&W AR AT AA FEA

gy, wfe fama faaw, 1960 FIHT AT FOT
% fou freafafag fow Tt 8, 290 —

1. (1) = frgwl = d@faeq am afrs o
(Fmee) e, 1994 &)
(2) 7 (93 | WFTOR T T FT HIT 20 )
2. afaw framm fgm, 1960 (548 =78 798
g w9 fram wET w0 d) F AT 24w, ‘=7
4 FY' wedi & T 9 A g mafas Y wer
g AW |
37w faa & fmw 28 & 3nfew (1) 4,
qwg #iT 3u-fraw  (4) F w1 odte 2 ¥
“0F 9" Weal F e 9T G 90 wEg Ty SrAf

820 GI/94

af fieelt, TAATT, WA 30, 1904/9% 9, 1916
NEW DELHI, WEDNESDAY, MARCH 30, 1994/CHAITRA 9, 1916

4. 7% 1w F faA 28% & 3afvaw (1) H
“of g mert e av “wr g’ mey vy S o

5. 4 feaw % fraw 37 % saiaq (3) & “ar
guiera (1®)” magl w0 fFEr S

6. (1) wF fraw #1 = 1 F wE&T T H,
we 3(3) (™) Feaw q€, [AFAGRT |98 T Ao
wrafd —

“(m) FoATEY A AGAT F TTEEFLT H gHCT-
ga ¥ saumifore wfr daw A sy 7

(2) =z 3(iii) (W) FrAWT FRAT ST

7. (1) ¥ frg| & #A3qs 1 F gwr s §F an
2(iil) (@) % = qv, fqratafas w7z @ o
AA ——

‘(@) TaAr g1 A A F TR % S|
ge F WARACGAT WfT AT & sroar )

(2) wx 3(ui) (7) F AT fFar qw |



8. {Er o &1 7y 1 %_s;'w;-rrtﬁ F, w& 3(iii)
(=) w=am qv Grafafgd a8 @y S ok ——
(@) Fady #r At ;oA & T £ s
# gl wfy " w0 srodr
(2) w2 3(ii1) (7) ® AT fear s
9. (1) y= fogw 1 #ATH 1 F www T Y,
=z 2(iii) () % #am a¢ fqeafafas o= <6y st
uqie -
“(a) woedy g @Y woelt £ TP rRTor £ HH-
@ Y wuAri wfq e Ay s )
(2) == 2(jii) (") 1 & BT srgaw
[®r. 7. 7/1/93—a™-6]
faamz 2=, d@g#a afaw
grg feoqor

qw fagwor wr. #@. f7. &, 1398 At
11-11-1960 g™ WA ¥ o ¥  wFfaT ffo
AT Y | TR AOEGAATS AT GHT FA & |

CEll

1. Figg=ar #er ua-2-169(44) 61
et 7-9-61

2. AOEFAAT |27 CH—2-152(58)61
ferts 30-1-63

3. wiagEAT wEr TH-2-152(11) 62
faaw 6-5-63

4 wfag=m dom  1/22/62—qH-2
femi® 18-7-63

5. AT W1 TA-2-152(37/62
faaiw 22-7-63

6. HMGAAT HEAT UA—2—169/44[1

TEAT® 6-9-63

7. wfaqear  gawar nH-2{152{33[60
fei® 24-9-63

8. mfogaar  Hear  1/26/66-0H—6
fw 4-3-67

9. wfigg==T wEAT 1/2/68WH-2
fmT® 23-2-68

10. stfag=ar &@sar 1/3/68-1H—2
fa=t% 30-2-68

11. ofgg==T #R o 13/68-—nH—g
feiiw 13-1-69

12. gfgg=ar d&3r 1/51/65—n7-2
fRAT® 26-2-69

4 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY

[PArRT II—SEc. 3()T

13. wigg=aT A% 1/34/68-TH—2

&% 23-5-70

14. wfug=ar  #@r 1/33/67~00-6 (WIT—~2)
frat 22-7-71

15. wugasT G5 1/3/71-00—6
fa % 6-9-71

16. wfug=ar dwar  1/26/71-v7—6
faai®s 14-2-72

17. wfergaar dwr 1/34/71--UH—6
fawiF 21-5-71

18. wfegaar dwar 1/74/75~w7-6
et 2-5-79

19, sfagerT dear 3/51/74-07—6
fai® 16-1-89

20. Hfg=AT "wAT 7/4/84-7H-6
faw® 22-9-86

21. wfgg=dr §@r 7/86/-nH—6
fami® 10-2-1987

22. wfgq=Ar qEar 19/9/87-1H-6
faaiF 14-10-87

23. WAFAAT GHAT 6[3[87-UH~6
faTiF 21-12-1987

24. wiamg=AT d@ear 7/2/87-09-6
fgard 13-4-88

25. Afagaar g&aT 7/1/89—~T0—6
fadie 19-10-89

26. Higg=EAT dWAT 7190776
fgat® 1-4-91

27. wfTgaar @eAr 7(3(92-07. -6
fei® 7-1-93

MINISTRY OF MINES
NOTIFICATION

New Delhi, the 30th March, 1994

G.S.R. 345(E).—In exercise of the powers
conferred by section 13 of the Mines and Minerals
(Regulation and Development) Act, 1957 (67 ot
1957), the Central Government hereby makes the
following rules further to amend the Mineral Con-
cession Rules, 1960, namely :—

1. (1) These rules may be called the Mineral
Concession (Amendment) Rules, 1994,

(2) They shall come into force on the date ot
their publication in the Official Gazette.



[wre TI--@8 3(i)]

WI &1 T59 . HFATEW 3

2. In rule 24B of the Mineral Concession Rules,
1960 (hereinafter referred to as the principal
rules), for the words “of ten years”, the words *‘not
gxceeding twenty years” shall be substituted.

3. In rule 28 of the principal rules, in sub-rule
(1), in the proviso and in Explanations 1 and 2
to sub-rule (4), for the words “one year”, the
words “two years” shall be substituted.

4. In rule 28A of the principal rules, in sub-
rule (1), for the words “one year”, the words
“two years” shall be substituted.

5. In rule 37 of the principal rules, in sub-rule
(3), the words “or sub-rule (1-B)” shall be omit-
ted.

6. (1) In Schedule 1 of the principal rules, in
Form B, for item 3(iii)b), the following item
shall be substituted, namely :—

“(b) a company, an attested copy of the certi-
ficate of registration of the Company
shall be enclosed.”,

(2) item 3(iii) (¢) shall be omitted.

7. (1) In Schedule I of the principal rules, in

Form E, for item 2(iii) (b), the following item
shall be substituted, namely:—

“(b) a company, an attested copy of the certi-
ficate of registration of the

company
shall be enclosed.”,

(2) item 2(iii) (¢) shall be omitted.

8. (1) In Schedule I of the principal rules, in

Form T for item 3(ii)(b), the following item shall
be substituted, namely:—

“(b) a company, an attested copy of the certi-
ficate of registration of the

company
shall be enclosed.”,

(2) item 3(iii) (¢) shall be omitted,

9. (1) In Schedule I of the principal rules, in

Form J for item 2(iii)(b), the following item shall
be substituted, namely:—

“(b) a company, an attested copy of the certi-

ficate of registration of the company shall
be enclosed.”,

(2 item 2(iii) (c) shall be omitted.

IE. No. 7(1)|93-M.VI]
DIVAKAR DEV, Jt. Secy.

Foot Note .

The principal rules were published vide No.
G.S.R. 1398, dated the 11th November, 1960, and

subsequently amended vide No. GS.R. ...... .
(1) Notification No. M.II-169(44)[61 dt.
7-9-61.
(2) Notification No. M.1}-152(58)[61 dt.
30-4-63.
(3) Notification No, M.II-152(11)|62 dt.
6-5-63.

(4) Notification
18-7-63.

No. 1(22)[62-M.II  dt.

(5) Notification No. M.II-152(37)[62 dt.
22-7-63.

(6) Notification No.
6-9-63.

M.II-169(44)[61 dt.

(7) Notitication No,
24-9-63.

M.II-152(33) |60 dt.

(8) Notification No,
4-3-67.

1(26)]66-M.VI dt.

(9) Notification No.
23-2-68.

1(2)/68-M.IT  dt.

(10) Notification  No.
30-3-68.

1(3)|68-M.VL dt.

(11) Notification No.
17-1-69.

1(3)[68-M.VI  dt.

(12) Notification No. 1(51)]65-M.II dt.
26-2-69. l

(13) Notification No. 1(34)|68-M.ITI dt.
23-5-70.

(14) Notification No, 1(33)[67-M.VI (Vol.
II) dt. 22-7-71.

(15) Notification No. [(3)[71-M.IV dt.
6-9-71,

(16) Notification N
14-2-72.

e

1(26)|71-M.VI dt,



4 THE GAZET1E OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [ParT II—SEC. 3(1)]

(17) Notification  No. 1(34)|71:M.VI dt. (23) Notification ~ No. 6(3)|87-M.V1 dt.
21-5-73. 21-12-87.
(18) Notification  No. 1(74)|75-M.VI  dt. (24) Notification No. 7(2)|87-M.VI dt.
2-5-79. 4.
13-4-88.
(19) Notification No. 3(51)|74-M.VI dt.
16-1-80. (25) Notification No. 7(1)|89-M.VI dt.
(20) Notification No. 7(4)[85-M.VI dt. 19-10-89.
22-9-86.
(26) Notification  No. 7(1)|90-M.VI dt.
(21) Notification No. 7(1)[86-M.VI  dt. 1-4-91. '
10-2-87.
(22) Notification No. 19(9)[87-M.VI  dt. (27) Notification No. 7(3)[92-M.VI dt.
14-10-87. 7-1-93.

Printed by the Manager, Govt. of India Press, Ring Road, Maya Puri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054, 1994



