
REGD. NO. D.L.-33004/94

The Gazette of India
EXTRAORDINARY

PART II—Section 3—Sub-section (i)

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

No. 140] NEW DELHI, WEDNESDAY, MARCH 30, 1994/CHAITRA 9, 1916

820 GI/94 (1)



4 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(1)1

MINISTRY OF MINES

NOTIFICATION

New Delhi, the 30th March, 1994

G.S.R. 345(E).—-In exercise of the powen
conferred by section 13 of the Mines and Minerals
(Regulation and Development) Act, 1957 (67 of
1957), the Central Government hereby makes the
following rules further to amend the Mineral Con-
cession Rules, 1960, namely :—

1. (1 ) These rules may be called the Mineral
Concession (Amendment) Rules, 1994.

(2) They shall come into force on the date ot
their publication in the Official Gazette.



3

2. In rule 24B of the Mineral Concession Rules,
1960 (hereinafter referred to as the principal
rules), for the words "oi' ten years", the words "not
exceeding twenty years" shall be substituted.

3. In rule 28 of the principal rules, in sub-rule
(1), in the proviso and in Explanations 1 and 2
to sub-rule (4), for the words "one year", the
words "two years" shall be substituted.

4. In rule 28A of the principal rules, in sub-
rule (1) , for the words "one year", the words
"two years" shall be substituted.

5. In rule 37 of the principal rules, in sub-rule
(3), the words "or sub-rule ( I B ) " shall be omit-
ted.

6. (1) In Schedule I of the principal rules, in
Form B, for item 3(iii)(b), the following item
shall be substituted, namely :—

"(b) a company, an attested copy of the certi-
ficate of registration of the Company
shall be enclosed.",

(2) item 3(iii)(c) shall be omitted.

7. (1) In Schedule I of the principal rules, in
Form E, for item 2(ii i)(b), the following item
shall be substituted, namely:-—

"(b) a company, an attested copy of the certi-
ficate of registration of the company
shall be enclosed.",

(2) item 2(iii)(c) shall be omitted.

8. (1) In Schedule I of the principal rules, in
Form I for item 3(iii)(b), the following item shall
be substituted, namely:—

"(b) a company, an attested copy of the certi-
ficate of registration of the company
shall be enclosed.",

(2) item 3(iii)(c) shall be omitted.

9. (J) In Schedule I of the principal rules, in
Form J for item 2(iii)(b), the following item shall
be substituted, namely:—

"(b) a company, an attested copy of the certi-
ficate of registration of the company shall
be enclosed.",

(2) item 2(iii)(c) shall be omitted.

IF. No. 7(1)|93-M.VD
DIVAKAR DEV, Jt. Secy.

Foot Note .

The principal rules were published vide No.
G.S.R. 1398, dated the 11th November, 1960, and
subsequently amended vide No. G.S.R

(1) Notification No. M.II-169(44)|61 dt.
7-9-61.

(2) Notification No. M.lM52(58)|6l d t
30-4-63.

(3) Notification No. M.II-152(11)|62 dt.
6-5-63.

(4) Notification No. 1(22)|62-M.II dt.
18-7-63.

(5) Notification No. M.II-152(37)|62 dt.
22-7-63.

(6) Notification No. M.II-169(44)[61 d t
6-9-63.

(7) Notification No. M.II-152(33)|60 dt.
24-9-63.

(8) Notification No. 1(26)[66-M.VI dt.
4-3-67.

(9) Notification No. 1(2)|68-M.II d t
23-2-68.

(10) Notification No. 1(3)]68-M.VI dt.
30-3-68.

(11) Notification No. 1(3)[68-M.VI d t
17-1-69.

(12) Notification No. l(51)[65-M.n d t
26-2-69.

(13) Notification No. 1(34)|68-M.II dt.
23-5-70.

(14) Notification No. 1 (33)|67-M.VI (Vol.
II) dt. 2,2-7-71.

(15) Notification No. 1(3)[71-M.IV d t
6-9-71.

(16) Notification No. 1 (26)171-M VI d t
14-2-72. '



4 THE GAZEITfc OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

(17) Notification No. 1(34)]71-M.VI dt.
21-5-73.-

(18) Notification No. 1(74)|75-M.VI dt.
2-5-79.

(19) Notification No. 3(51)|74-M.VI dt.
16-1-80.

(20) Notification No. 7(4)|85-M.VI dt.
22-9-86.

(21) Notification No. 7(1)|86-M.VI dt.
10-2-87.

(22) Notification No. 19(9)|87-M.VI dt.
14-10-87.

(23) Notification No. 6(3)]87-M.Vl dt.
21-12-87.

(24) Notification No. 7(2)|87-M.VI dt.
13-4-88.

(25) Notification No. 7(1)|89-M.VI dt.
19-10-89.

(26) Notification No. 7(l)|90-M.VI dt.
1-4-91.

(27) Notification No. 7(3)|92-M.VI dt.
7-1-93.

Printed by the Manager, Govt. of India Press, Ring Road, Maya Puri, New Delhi-llUU64
and Published by ihe Controller of Publications, DeJhi-110054, 1994


