el (v = )-127 aw:uﬂncn NI D (DN 127

— - e
wawr - B r

@lw @mzetm of ggwm

AATATIAl
EXTRAORDINARY

wir H—wvy 3—3c-uvy (1)
PART II—Section 3—Sub-section (1)

STyt & sewe
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

de 94] nf fapolt, GrRwIT, WA 11, 1991/WF[A 20, 1912
No. 94} NEW DELHI, MONDAY, MARCH 11, 1991/PHALGUNA 20, 1912

va v o et g der o arft f teed T ug wenr wwTr @ o W
TeT W T

Soprate Puging is piven te this Part In order that it may be filed as a
separafe compilation

T W qTA HATET 2. =§rﬁm ﬁmu?r ﬁrm:r, 1960 H,— -
(@ faar) (1) fraw 9, wSufmw  (2) #—
S (i) =vs (%) ¥, ao@ & wwaw frefata

TEAF ST AOAT, FART-—
78 famell, 20 ®vady, 1991 ‘o o o B afx wm 21
ar.ar.f. 129()—Ew G@T, gw WK arftardt o mede fafads e g

mfaw  (fafmma s faww)  wlafam, 1957 ar oA SHTA, aarferfa, ATfRTY
(1957 %1 67) 4% a1 13 T saw wfEE & # aeft weeftar<d ar wigge fafrde weowy

panr #v9 g, afvy forr fuw, 1960 w1 oY ® w7 qEeai gra form som (7

et w7 ¥ fau faefafag faw gandr 2 (1i) =oe (&) & sqrA gt famfafas ave <ar
iy — SO, T
1. (1) g5 faodt 7 wfe A afew “(‘_j) fafer & ua aww Fq?srﬁw T
Py ((w?vﬁuw) for, 199131 Tl qf gEE Enfed ® ot agp
_ wag e grw w3 fam ¥ ar i
(2) @ TS ¥ wFwE &7 qror@ ® gaE dfar wrow 599 & fau aeft ¥ gady
g 1 agafy wfsrer & A 2.

684 G1/91 a



2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY

[P’ART IT—Sec. ’*(i)]

i ag fr sl afw mam?\«“mrrﬁrar ﬁ"
a0 OF 4T AT ATIOARAT ALY BT

o, a8 e fF s o&w argmd faelr wmw
# qaEw wfpm g &7 & fao e A agefy
qaaw wgEfa & froames & qvam fiq o o
FyAW &7 7 oqF &Y araEr 1

(2) fram 10% ®1 @ BT S

(3) fraw 11, sfewm (1) ® ‘awg ww
vl & A T ‘AT Wed TR SO

(4) Fga 13 & wfes (2) S gufaag
(3) &1 @M fear SO

(5) 13 & qw=r  frafafgs fow
wAgrfrr  fer o, salg—

“1a% qamor gafa ¥ adRe A g oaw
mAard  &r  grfeaft — (1) W@t qdww swfE
Fy A & Pt mrww o), 90 qdew AeARa
TARE MW g ¥ 9d oy g et #oamt
qFaw wmfE A WA ¥ wase wr g fafe
sfafafy grar fpar Tar gwar stroar ;

(2) 88 wmasw 41 =W ¥ ST W gAWW
gt WOv @A wr owww s faar
st § fbe) faw 15 & waftew (1) §
fafeez faopr & fromaw & qF Tt
T g A F TR AW w1 qaw & fafow
gfafafie & = & fFm owa mwa
T

(6) fanm 14, wofm (1), =ow (i) ¥
wgF & qearq famlafes ogE ser oo,
iy —

“ad 7g X fF oafs wvegs ¥ guane (@)
T gwmve (%) ¥ fafesr wwn & wfus fedy
qEr #r O AAT ST ¥ oA IS Y ST
A &, @ e wwe wfes wmar § o
7T MT FIHT & o v wfaeit & em
FI W FT dRr )’

(7) frr 22, safeaw (3), aoe (1) §,—

(i) smve (%) & frwfafas oemge e
WOAT, Wi —

‘g oy B ool @ AN ariaedy w9

gt wgdz fafadzs svoft § @ Gar wwroras,

mqrfeafy, anfray &d & ot weay ar

wgaz  fafidy sreT & ot e g faar

ST 1

1

(u) FTEVS (?.) q '-—“-—-—Jﬁr_rfT’T AFTY WeART
fagar CaAeE ww o arfag afas
g weAwarlta fEr S
(iii) swave (@) & wq@ o fefAfE
ITATE  IET AT, HUT
“(o) Ffmr W oam waw fF waEE ¥, WET
aff gk enfrd § @ 3, Al Awg wfawe
e wT A & oar @A wfgar wveew w9
Ffam vl §oeay agwir wfasra w5
A
anqug & wgr qfa avEr & eqrfwer ¥ ¥
TgF BF Fuw 1 AvAvEEAT w@ g
9v a8 W 5 3 sa gt e fodl e i
wqq  ®ORTT WO wer & [ vy e
wgufy gzer favw ¥ frommw & oarE e
9 AF H WA wOY ¥ oF Y srea
qve ag s Y fF Al w0 e W At
o wzufa &Y wravrear wd g 9E 93E
¥ SR % AW wEwtd 9gw &1 miasT
FLA TR
(8) fom 22@, swfem (1) # " awm
vedl F qur OT qErE 'TH wiiawa wiEEr”
g aeqegrfar fEm oo )

(9) faw 22 @@ d,—
(1) sufrw (1) % “wfigfaa sfiwrd =
e & o’ el & e qv mfu-
gfed wifasr & weaw § s & e
TEE TG AT
(i1) safars (2) & ‘#rf =fe’ =S F e
qv “fram 54 & SwEEt & W gC M,
#r% =" wer W@ SO
(10) faam 24 A, —
(i) wafrae (1) ¥ “awgAw’ @&t F o
qv “gY a9 ey & S,
(i) safaa (6) &, ‘@@ A1’ wesl & W
qr ‘& Fa wer @ SR
(11) fraw 24%, vafraw (6) &, “@@a agi & wuw
A & fft wdew w7 Ry & M 9
gy faam (5) F AT F FE g oY, ;AT
T & waw qEw F R wEem w0 owe
TF AR
(12) faq 25 & qmEw, fFeafafa T geaeafe
foar s, oA -
“25%. @MY W5 & WEAZF AL N 9T AYEA
Fy srfeafa— (1) Gﬁgvrrm 9 ¥ WA AT FefiE



[Wr‘T IT—am 3(i)]
¥ fedr wdaw *, -?—r AT q"g‘ F TADT AT IAH
AT F AR T T q@ A WA § del @
9f F AL AT IAF FAEFT & ;AT F1 I ffew
sfafafadt gro far T g@Ar A

(2) fmer Wi mrdad A1 F0T F fraeEy avaw wAw
9% & WAAE A7 IAS FAAHC0 KT ARW FT
famr v &, feeg @€ 31 % Suftaq (1) @
fafeez frerw & fAoqmT & g3 e g9
growrAY & mEw w0 qaw & fafiee af«fafu
¥ A § Frar war qwAT Fear”;
faga 26, safTas (3) &, “de faq” =€t
wqry 97 s f&q’ omes vad S

(14) fram 27 7~

(i) safraw (1) ®, @2 () & w9 faea-
frifad @ AT S, sl

(13)

(7)) wgrr AqTTE ar faskr T fFT a7 3q-
Feft & AUEET AT GASAT T Avel wew)-
Fror % fao wafad =1 S fear
;S

(ii) wafraa (5) & ®@m g farafafaa
gafaqR @t [T, wafd —

“(5) afragEm avT 9 AT AT wmrfacy
# Ham W AT AT 9F FT HIATTAIL
gfqard weF & garg § safasq ey & ay
Fifas (1) & vz (%) 4 faftee o &
foamr gafraw (1), (2) =% (3) &
fafaez wat 7 & fFfr %1 357w Few & oA
Teg AT AT &, gatfeafy, -
farg ot g wizd A JeAuT A
gfagfa ®v1 F1 wAaT 9 go, @ G
1 g1 & R gfy gF @e fam A
wgfy & waw warfaea ar giqamd arew
qr Jevma & afagfla ¥ A0 gem Tt
fmr AET § AT TSA A9ETY IT -
arfgt 9 ufess 9w = faen, S
gaw freg &7 o awdt § 0F & adEa
wy @t ot gl faferg wirafa ar
ECCORTANC I A c i Rk )

(15) fagw 28 ®, *wdiEn & ward 77 fFreatatas

STCXYFTOT TAT S, WAE, —

‘e 19 @qd Uz ® fAmmE &y
mwarr{mmﬁmﬁa?q”ﬁvw s
freaffad Fr arad wrved a8 & AT §—

(F) @ag wHFrT & word § fames; ar

(f) TEET @4 F Fewr fwa # faewa;

TS 6T T © ST 3

()mﬁﬁrraﬁ“rqﬁmsrfmmﬁfm
qr

(7) &t ar feelY faefim wearsit i facfia
AZAAT ST A ¥ faqem; ar
freft m S ¥ @t s qft glafrea
AT, TSt ugare @@y g oar faawd
va% 50 wfawa & weqm frafea fgg &
T 9ZAR AREEER WT F W99 9d, Fra
waldT B SRSy WEm WgT F A
qET AT A&7 Y19 "R qg fasre
Fafy 5 #at oF ad 7 wafw § wiww
F1 fadae wmafy & fou gaw  gfwa
FIEH 7 & F 47T FTCT |
WQEETHT 2: 5@l THl afFAet F  mRed &
quar] UF aq & fadae wafy & fAg mww @
farafiafigs @ ar@y sl g @t srdr §,——

(%) fBdt s@AT ar afas sl g
arRm 5T sty ¥ oar

(@) wfxard seofes et g st &, ar
(W) gEATT Av AT BT AT €

AT TR WEF FY F ooOd 9@ g
qAfaT AEATRAT HIEA WA FA A AHH
EAT &, &gl v avEw gy A &}
Tt fm Far o 76 § sfgw A fdaar
wafr & fag gffa 1 <@T & @i
e &1

(16) fraw 28 % ww=q faefafas fraw wrearfaa
AT s, sl —

“ogw.(1) wgl W €A @wd 9 % frorad

T TG T U FG iy wAw F frac @ =

T & v FE O oawd fdew | o

qAEA @AT &, A1 UF 9% 7 wafgs A wafyg

# fau  awa af g waEr g oagl 3% oy

QT FT AT F R T HH OE AT T et

F WIgT FROT §T €T FIT §T, T ATH(T

T UT WA TTGT HE WA -

T dg B oug w1 %W Ty F ol 9F Ry
aneT wafg & Aww & a7 afew qF: waiaw T8
far Tar & )

(2) wuftaw (1) % 9" ToF w@ET & &9 500

I 1 FrA adfy guefr o
(3) =t AR TR (1) F wmiig /o
08 WEET @ w93 oftv @dw afmard
HIFA A FXA OT Ieg &% HOT & FEOT A0
qiear iR wEfaag F dag F aWaE H]

(¥)



4 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA E*(TRAORD[NARY

e L T T R ST TS T I T IS T T e e ——— -

g 7, frumw 28 ¥ mefwowr ¥ fafafeee
foara o3 faw wlt ot @ & 97 wwda W
aRW arfeg w4

17. fAaw 29 ¥—
(i) suffas (1) ¥~
(%) @® (%) & qai awgw #1 AW foar

SITUT;

(@) TR oogw & T, frefafer oegs
aRyEtd fRar s, sty
arg g WO B qdwe ®,
frafafar wat #1 oo w0 0%
9% A WA F DO Haw fiT w7
o % &da f wedn v & fAg
s T ST —

(i) s werdm & & ¥ w0 i
ag A wafa  Awm & W ¥
ey

(1) maq arar foag e i
qad goNT afeiea ¥, % Sqady
F WA HC far weaT §0;

(1) wefmaw (2) & g frewfafes 9w-
from  seacTaTfaq PR oo, Wt —

“(3) myaad F Al W & meanin
F  HOF®  WEIA ¥, I9F S
N gl ¥ G a9 & wafy
F Wae  freerr stom Wi afz
IoET T@ s & ofige fwem
gt fRUT s & AU SR AR
fpar . wEEAT WO

(18) fmw 35 &, “@9M wg ¥ afw afa”

R ¥ W 9T ‘w9 & we

AT ;

(1) sofma (1) ¥, “wsw §OFR #
fafer 9@ «@guls & fawr’’ wsst
& gr ‘e goee wr fefag
@ agafg & faar st wifufrs
#F owaw  owgd W fafafae
E A1 & S G - L S
#Y aar ¥ T gt F QEiaET
F far’ me weaweatfia fag
KA ;

(i) sufem (1F) ¥ #§ =y (%) &
o we faeafafaa @
e, Wi —

[P'ART U-——-SEC 3(i)]

“(aﬁ) B At ¥, et mAw A
A7 fwET & wEww 9

wfeETy gro 9gw W weEEa

T #, o wasAtfer wEA A
LG G G i TV S B 0
FUT AT FUI0 & A1 ¥ TR
g foag Rt nfosdt & aws
HIHRT ga AT 7 afaw
frway & ®@%q Ay wEU L

20) fram 42 %, gofqEd (2) F W

qv, fawfafa Jafqaw AT
JCAT, WA

“(2) ww TR F @EERT &
frama, wmfirfras & ogelt o ®
fafafesr fedlt afaw  ® swa £
TR qAAfd ar WA agt AEd
Tt o soar 0

(21) fram 45 % @=@vy (i) &

qUETE frerfafas v T
et i, wal —

(1%) gaq  "@fwar @S BT W
gAifr @A g & s &
AL

(22) fraw 54 &  wqudmwvr W

wa &% fao wmeEl & wd 9w
“srator @r wede % faw’ wes
w SR

23) fem 55 ¥ sufmm (1) R

(2) & v o faefafam  9ofqan
T WEAR, T ——

“(1) fraw 54 % wmfw gEOEW
& frey s w1 omifer v ge
afaat Toa geEre wr me wfuETd
st avfy  mfweifea qeFTd Y,
g W R g RO T gEA &
W FT & aE ¥ W A &
iae ot feeaford  or AwE
G SrUAY ST TWET TR AT Wl
AT EAEA Sy COE =1 1 & £ 0
&g g &1 feoaforat  Aad ang,
feoqforst & wE g s 9w
F oot gak g qesifR R
a4 R SHT wA (R od A E
¥, ¥ YRR SEET ATgA uAr maw
qifer g |aft St 5 oag wqfeEa
Tud |



[srer [T——arwe 3(1)] W a

qgsre w0 WA fewifogt wea
TR A, HGFAT F A w4
SEAT= G B 1 B R i
are fewfgt G495 F fa0 W
1 wo fag 4 dwa wE, SR
arr feeafmat ot awa 07 qawR
WY gAY GETRITT T SRR GST
(24) fraw 59, IIfaw (1) #—-
(1) =0z (@) &AM fEar Foow ;

(it) fawfafza =g, mv3 (v) % awsiq
wqwgrfr  far s, sat -

(=) waq 7 faw wET wATET @
fam, fa wewy @0 ww el
wrfgwrdr i mefd @ fAar
@ g

(ili) vmoe (i) & &9 gav  ovegs
& grarq  freafafaa owgE me-
e fear SO, weE o —

‘mreg g e W R owgt v 1
Fr 3T (1) % fAeegAi #
HIEAT @A gl ¥ wefie
qifm wmi @@ 2, =g @ve
(i) & st foefl mfngear &
IR T L S -V 5
I

(25) fraq o4% H, "wmg slAma’ e %
gt g CAdra wfqma’’ wex | wiad

(26) ATgAT 1 H—

(%) s=a 1, 4w 3 #H, (xviil) wfafte
% oW ox famfafga sfafe wd
FaAT, AT, ——
“(xviil) mwes, wrefafa, st
g, sfafafr wET & ooafas
fariwr & gqfrorg #re Ay fox
R @yl & frafor & @e-ang
dd ¥ oy 70 Qe & =ty &
gu um for |7

(@) W'Y T H—

(i) waxy, der 3 &, “gmg i
Al & e qe < gfaer
mWEE W SEW
(ii) s VIL 4 11w &, “a@m
afufaw, 1952”7 W= AT AF F

VTG ; {HIATIO

e 9T oqE afufagy, 1952 Uik
A AW WU faaei”’ weE Eiw
*F T AOY
(i) wrr VIL, &1 3 #, (%) oai
gaR a9zl WeEl ¥ wrtW g et
S O L I e B B
9T AT BT AT AT W T
av  famafefaa zar sowm, wat —
"mad wgl  miafiad F 3Tl o
gg@iA @t o fAgdl & FRewdt
v gaEdl ¥ weEww anw g7
() 3afEt & faae 24% & wAAE’
wedi & =am ov fawafwfes mw @
EICCEECICERES
sgfafrra & gedai ot gl
qarg a0 faRi  Faaard’ |

(7) wET 7 W, WA 3, 4 AT 4W A
A A0 Saar "9 IR R
gr  freafafags Wz @ o«
qqq —
“3(%) SH WEW  HT HEF W
A Aqr &g arfusra faad wEm
F fyeg  qAOwm AEE HEA
fRaT AT 20
(@) wrdzF  F AEW AT AT FT
v | .
4 (%) af =T PR WAR A AT AET

g Ar sy g grw awd foua,
srardw Ay e & fRT mmEgd &

gty & @A

() afz wEma  wfs fmaa & A
fedr  wEEA [ owTW A AEA & Al
freafafas  fafifa &7, —

(1) 71 T R/IIF A H

far &
(ii) 7r  gqdwm  wasfm oy @FT g F
frg &

(iii) @8 wragd &1 AT

(iv) af wdwvw 7 fam § @ A
AT W BAAW At a0 A
deni® AT e gar ag dve
fag aw  wenfa ugr wEA R
W



6 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA :

EXTRAORDINARY {ParT II—SEC. 3(1)]

(i) gE¥afiz qeeamqadl ANFTT Y AT A,
qdax  FATAI  F T FT HeATF
A qrig gar ag @rda (qarag) faw
g% 4 #qaa fRg wg 17

[wr=m . 7(1)/90um. . ]
g far, g afwa
qre favqer
ax fraw qd  geifad gur | dafaa sfagae
F qifewr AT IFT § —

1. ufag=sar €. 1/34/71-0". 6 ar@ 21 W%,
1973

2. sfagar denr o Il-152(37) /62 aiia
22 ATE, 1963

3. ufarg=aT & 1(34)[68—THo 6 qTAT 23 WE,
1970

4. wfagaAT A 1(26)]71-THo 6 ATA 14 F7AL,
1972

5. wfagadar 9. 1(2)/68-THo 6 TG 23 FAY,
1968
6. wfagesam &, 1(3)/6s8-mw-1I ardta 30 W=,
1968 :

7. mfugaar &, ow. I1l-169(44)[61 ardm
7 faqs9%, 1961

8. sfagwar & . 1 22) /620w, I ol 18 9,
1963

9. Afag=ATE. 1(74)[75THo sAIE 2%, 1979

10. Afag=rE. 1(3)/68-THo 6T 17 I,
1968

11. wfggaar gear 1(33)/67-T#0 6 (ameqw 1)
ar. 22 9ars, 1971

12. sfggam &, aw. Il-169(44)/61 @i
6 faasay, 1963

13. gfugaard. 1(3)[71-09. 6 arig 6 faaway,
1971 ,

14. wigg=ar &, 1(51)[65Tme Il  arfm
26 ®IIL, 1969

15. sifagaar . wio Il-152(11) /62 ardim 6 w%,
1963

16. wiAg=AT .
16 SMaU, 1980

3(51)[74THe 6 ardrE

17. HEgT .
30 wda, 1963

ua-ll-152(58)/61 ardrg

18. mfrgsrr &.  awo II-152(33)[60 ai@
24 faaeaz, 1963

19. ufagaar &, 1(26)[66-TR0 6 qTUT 4 A,
1967

20. AAGTATE, 7(4)[85Tw0 6 ai@ 22 faaway,
1986 '

21. gfagaar &, 7(1)/86-7H0 6 AT&@ 10 FEE,
1987

22. wlggaar .
14 #FET, 1987

23. HUITE. 6(3)/87-GH0 6 aiia 21 faq¥qw,
1987

24. sfagaaT . 7(2)/87-THo 6 ATAT 13 WA,
1988

19(9)/86-THe 6 TqT™

25. HAGAATE. 7(1)[89-THo 6 AT 19 HFIT,
1989

MINISTRY OF STEEL AND MINES
(Khan Vibhag)
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 20th February, 1991

G.S.R. 129(E) —In exercise of the powers con-
ferred by section 13 of the Mines and Minerals (Re-
gulation and Development) Act, 1957 (67 of 1957),
the Central Government hereby makes the following
rules further to amend the Mineral Concession Rules,
1960, namely :—

1. (1) These rules may be called the Mineral Con-
cession (Amendment) Rules, 199C.

(2) They skall cowre into force on the date of their
publication in the official Gazetic.

2. In the Mineral Concession Rules, 1960,—
(1) In rule 9, in sub-rule (2), —

(i) in clause (d), after the proviso, the follow-
ing proviso shall be added, namely :—-

“Provided further that in case the applicant
is a partnership firm or a private limited
company such certificate shall be furnisn-
ed by all partners of the partnership firm
or, as the case may be, all members of
the private limited company”;

(i) for clause (g), the following clause shall be
substituted, namely :—

“(g) a statement In writing that the applicant,
where the land is not owned by him, has
obtained sutface rights over the area or
has obtained the consent of the uwner
for starting prospecting operations :

Provided that no such statement shall be neces-
sary where the land is owned by the
Government . ’



[srr Tz 3(1)]

AT FT U9 © {AETW 7

Provided further that the consent o: the owner
for starting prospecting operations in the
area or part thereof may be furnished
after exccution of the prospecting licence
but before entry into the said area.”;

(23 Rule 10 A shall be omitted;

3) In rule 11, in sub-rule (1), for the words
“twelve months” the words “two years” shall be sub-
stituted;

(4) Tn rule 13, sub-rules (2) and (3) shall be omit-
ted;

{5} After rule 13, the following rule shall be in-
serted, namely :—

“13 A, Status of grant on death of the applicunt
for prospecting licence.—(1) Where an
applicant for the grant of a orospecting
licence dies before the order granting him
a prospecting licence is pasced. the applicant
for the grant of a prospecting licence shall
be deemed to have been made by his legal
representative,

(2) In the case of an applicant in respect of
whom an order ¢ranting a prospecting
licence is passed but who dies before the
deed referred to in sub-rule (1) of rule 15
is executed, the order shall be deemed to
have been passed in the name of the legal
representative of the deceased.”

(6) Tn rule 14. in sub-rule (D). in clause (ii), after
the provisq, the following proviso shall be added,
namely -—

“Provided further that if any guantity in excess
of the quantities specificd in sub-clause (b)
and sub-clause (¢) of the nroviso is won
and carried away, the State Government
may recover the cost of the excess quantity
of minerals won and darried away.”;

(7) In rule 22. in sub-rule (3), in clause (i), —

() to sub-cluse (d), the following proviso shall
be added, namely :— )

“Provided that in case the applicant is a part-
nership firm or a private limited com-
vany.. such certificate shall be furnished
by all partners of the partnership firm or,
as the case may be, all members of the
private limited company.”;

fi) in sub-clause (e), after the words “Central
Government” the words “or duly authorised
officer” shall be inserted.

(iii) for sub-clause (h), the following sub-clause
shall be substituted, namely :—

“(h) a statement in writing that the anplicant
has, where the land s not owned by him,
obtained surface rihgts over the area or
has obta‘ned the consent of the owner
for starting mining operations :

Provided that no such statement. <hall he
necessary where the land is owned by the
Government ;

Provided further that the consent of the owner
for starting mining operations in the area
or part thereof may be furnished after
execution of the lease deed but before
entry into the said area:

Provided alos that no further consent would
be required in the case of renewal where
consent has already been obtained dming
grant of the lease;”;

(8) In rule 22 B, in sub-rule (1) after the words
“Central Government” the words “or duly authorised
officer” shall be inserted,

@) In rule 22 BB, —

(i) in sub-rule (1), for the words “approval to
the authority” the words “approval through
the authority” shall be substiuted;

(i) in sub-rule (2), for the words “Any parson”,
the words “Notwithstanding the nrovisions
of rule 54, any person” shall be substituted :

(10) In rule 24, —

() in sub-rule (1), for the words. “twelve
mont hs”. the words “two years” shall be
substituted;

(ii) in sub-mle (6). for the words. “twelve

months” the
substituted:

(11) Tn rule 24A, in  cub-rule (6). for thc words
“Tf an anolicantion for first renewal”, the words
“Notwithstanding the n+ovisons of sub-rule (5), if an
application for renewal” shall be substituted:

(12) After rule 25, the
insered, namely :—

words “two years” shall be

following rule shall be

“25A. Statns of the grant on the death of anpli-
cant for mining lease.—(1) Wher= an ap-
nlicant for grant or renewal of mining lease
dies before the order granting him a mining
If_tase or its renewal is massed. the apnlica-
tion for the arant or tenewal of a mining
leace shall be deemed to have been made
bv his legal renresentative,

(2 Tn the cace of an anplicant in respect of
whom an order eranting or repewine a min-
ing lease Lq nassed, but who dies hafore the
rjeed referred to in eub-rule (1) of rule 31
s executed. the order shall be deemed to
have ‘heen massed i1 the name of the legal
representative of the deceased.”: B

(13Y In rule 26. in
“thirty days’,
stituted;

sub-rule (3). for the wards
the words “sixty days” shall be sub-

(14) In rule 27, —

(1) in sub-rule (). for clause fu). the following
clause shall be substituted, namelv —

“(n) fhe lessee shall store proverlv the rauti-
117_ed or non-saleable sub-orade ores or
minerals for future beneficiation”;



8 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA :

EXTRAORNDINARY [ParT TT—SEC. 3()]

(ii) for sub-rule (5), the following sub-rule shali
be substituted, namely :—

“(5) 1f the lessee makes any defuult in the
payment of royalty as required under
section 9 or payment of dead rent ay re-
quired under section 9A or com-
mits a breach of any of the con-
ditions specified in subrules (1), (2)
and (3), except the condition refer-
red to in clausc (f) of sub-trule (1), the
State Government shall give notice to the
lessce  requiring him to pay the royalty
or dead rent or remedy the brcach, as
thc case mav be, within sixty davs from
the date of the receipt of the notice and
if the royalty or dead reat is not paid or
the breach is not remedied within the said
period, the State Government may, with-
out prejudice to any other proccedings
that may be taken against him, determine
the lease and forfeit the whole or part of
the security deposit.’™;

(15) In rule 28, for the Explanaticn. the following
Explanations shall be sub-tituted, namely: —

“Explanation 1: Where the non-commencement
of the mining operations within a period of
one vear from the date of execution of min-
ing lease is on account of —

(a) delay in acquisition of surface rights; or

(b) delay in getting the possession of the leased
area; or

(¢} delayv in supply or installation of machi-
nery; or ”

(d) delay in getting financial assistance from
banks, or any financial institutions; or

(e) ensuring supolv of the mineral in an in-.

dustry of which the lessee is the owner
or in which he holds not less than 50
per cent of the controlling interest-

and the lessee is able to furnsh documentary evidence
supported by a dulv sworn affidavit, the State Gov-
etnment mav consider if there are sufficient reasons
for non-commencement of operationg for a continu-
ous period of more than one vyear,

Explanation 2 : Where the discontinnance of
mine operations for a continuous veriod of
one vear after the commencement of such
operations is an account of :—

(a) orders passed by any statntory or judicial
authority; or

(b) soerations becoming  highly uneconomi-
cal; or

(¢) Strike or lock out:

and the Iessee is able to furnish documentarv evidence
suonorted by a dnlv sworn affidavit, the State Gov-
ernment mav consider if there are sufficient reasons
for discontimnance of operations for a  cont'nuouns
period of more than one year.”;

(16) After rule 28, the following rule shall be in-
serted, namely :—

“28A. (1) Where a lessee is unable to commence
the mining operations within a perio| of
onc year from the datc of excculion of the
mining lease, or discontinucs mining opera-
tiong for a period of exceeding one yecar for
reasons beyond his control, he mav submit
an application to the Statc Government ex-
plaining the reasons for the same at least
within six months from the date of its lapse:

Provided that the lcase has not been re-
vived under this provision for more than
twice during the entire period of the lcase.

(2) Every application under sub-rule (1)
shall be accompained by a fee of Rs. 500]-

(3) The State Government on recgipt of
an application made under sub-rule (1) and
on being satisfied about the adequacy and
genuineness of the reasons for non-com-
mencement of mining operations or discon-
tinuance thereof taking not consideration the
matters specified in the Exolanation to rule
28, pass ao order reviving the lease.”;

(17) In rule 29,
(i) in sub-rule (1), —

(2} clause (c) in the second proviso shall be
omitted;

(h) after the second proviso, the following
proviso shall be inserted, namely : —

“Provided alse that surrender of the lcase area
by the lessee shall be vermitted onlv thrice
during the period of the lease on fulfilling
the conditions —

(1) that atleast a period of five years has
clapsed since the last surrender; and

(i) that the provisions of the minina plant
including the environment management
plan thereof have been complied with.”;

(ii) after sub-rule (2), the following sub-rule
shall be Inserted namely :—

“(3} Bvery apnlication for the surrender of
a part of the lease-hold area shall be dis-
posed of within twelve months from the
date of its receipt and, if it is not so dis-
posed of within that period. it shall he
deemed to have been refused.”;

(18) Tn rule 35, for the words “held under mining
]eas(el" the words “of a mining lease” shall be substi-
tuted;

(19) In rule 37, —

() in sub-rle (1), after the words “the State
Govt.” the words “‘and in the case of min-
ing lease in respect of any mineral speci-
fied in the [First Schedule to the Act. with-
out the previous anproval of the Central

Government” shall be inserted:



[er M-z 3(i)]

T 6T TG ey 2oy 9

(ii) in sub-rule (1A), foc clanse (a), the follow-
ing clause shall be substituted. namely :—

*“(a) prepare a mining, plan and programme
of ¢xtration duly approved by an autho-
rity appointed by the Central Govern-
ment fin cases where such a plan and pro-
gramme has not been already appdoved
by the competent authority and also
agrecs to undertake mining operations in
accordance with the approved mining
paln;n;

(20) In rule 42, fod sub-rule (2) the following sub-
rule shall be substituted, namely :—

“(2) Except with the previous approval of the
Central Government, no prospecting licence
or mining lcase shall be granted in res-
pect of any mineral specified in the First
Schedule to the Act.”;

(21) In rule 45, after clause (i), the following
clause shall be inserted, namely :—

“(ia) mining operations shall be undertaken in
accordance with the duly approved mining
plan;™;

(22) In rule 54, in Explanation, aftcr the words
“for transfcr”, the words “for surrender” c<hall be
insetted;

(23) In rule 55, for sub-rules (1) ang (2) the
following sub-rules shall be substituted, namely :—

“(1) On receipt of an application for revision
under rule 54, copies thereof shall be sent
to the State Govt. or other authority and to
all the impleaded parties calling upon them
to make such comments as they may like
to make within threc months from the date
of issue of the communication, and the State
Government or other authority and the im-
pleaded parties, whils furnishing comments
to the Central Government shall simultane-
ously endorse a copy of the comments to
the other parties :

Provided that in the case of deemed re-
fusal, the Central Government may pass
such order in relation thereto, ag ir may
deem appropriate.

(2) Comments received from any party under
sub-rule (1) shall be sent to the other parties
for making such further comments as they
may like to make within one month from
the date of fssue of fre commumication and
the partics making further comments  shall
send them to all th: other parties.”,

24y In rule 59, in sub-rule {(1,—
(i) clavse (b) shall be omitted:

(i) the following clause shall be inserted after
clause (e), namely :—

“(f) which has been reserved by the Govern-
ment or any Jocal authority for any pur-
pose other than mining™:

684 GI91-—2

(iti) the following proviso shall be inserted after
the second proviso under sub-clause (i),
namely :—

“Provided also that where an area held under
prospecting licence is granted in terms of
sub-section (1) of section 11, no notifica-
cation under clause (ii) shall be required
to be issued.”;

(25) In rule 64A, for the words “fifteen per cent”
the words “twenty four per cent” shall be substituted;

(26) Tn Schedule 1, —

(A) In Form I, in paragraph 3, for the entry
(xviii), the following entry shall be subst-
tuted, namely :—

“(xviif) A repoct giving the details of nrospect-
ing carrieq out in the area together with
assessment of the ore reserves, geological
plans, results of chemical analysis of the
representative samnles, and borcholes and
IOES-”;

(B) in Form K,—

(iy Tn Part VI, in paragraph 3, for the words
“fifteen  per cent” the words “twenty-
four per cent” shall be substituted;

(i) in Part VII, in_ paragraph 11B, for the
words and figure “Mines Act, 1952” the
words and figures “Mines Act, 1952 and

the rules made thereunder” shall be sub-
stituted;

(ili) in Part VIIT, in paragraph 3,—

(@) for the portion beginning  with the
words  “whére the mining lease” and
ending with the words “option of the
]cssecﬁcssces;” the following shall be
substituted namely :—

¢ mining lease is renewable in terms of
the  provisisions of the Act and the
rules made therennder.”;

(b) for the words and figure with letter, “in
accordance with rule 24A of the said

rules”, the following words shall be sub-
stituted, namely +—.

“in accordance with ths provisions of  tha
Act and the rules made thereunder”

.
3

(c) in Form ‘N’, for items 3. 4 and 4A the

following items shall be substituted
namely (—

“3. (a) Number and  date of order and
authority  ~assing  the order against

which revision application g filed;

(b) Date of communications of the order
to the applicant,

A (a) If the application is in respect of  decmed
rejection, the date of receipt of the application for

rgincm] concession, surrender or transfer by the State
ovt.;



10 THE GAZET']E OF INDIA : EXTRAORDIINARY [PART IT—SEec. 3()]

(b) If the mpplcatlon is lin respect of an order made 4, Notification No, 1(26)[71-M VI dt. 14-2-72
on an application for mineral concession, specify — 5. Notification No. 1(2)]68-M.II dt. 23-2-68
(i) whether for grant or renewal; 6. Notification No. 1(3)|68-M.II dt, 30-3-63
(i) whether for prospecting licence or for min- 7. Notification No. M.II-169(44)]61 dt.7-9-61
ing lease; 8. Notification No. 1(22)/62-M.IT dt, 18-7-63
(i) date of such application; 9. Notification No. 1(74)|75-M.VI dt. 2-5-79
(iv) if for renewal, the number and date of letter 10. Notification No. 1(3)|68-M.VI dt. 17-1-68
of the State Government conveying the 1. Notification No. 1(33)l67-M.VI  (Vol.Il)
grant and the date upto which licence|lease dt. 22-7-71
was granted: | 12. Notification No. M.IT-169 (44) |61 dt. 6-9-63
O e aumer and date” of Teter. ot catlier 13, Notification No, 1(3)[7(-M.VI dt. 6-9-71
grant(s) and date(s) upto which grant(s) 14, Notification No. 1(51}{65-M.II dt. 26-2-69
have been made.”. 15. Notification No, M.II-152(11]62 dt. 6-5-63
[File No., 7(1)[90-M.VI] 16. Not-iﬁcat-iorl No. 3(51)|74-M. VI dt. 16-1-80
SURENDRA MISHRA, It Secy. 17. Notification No. M. I1-152(38)61 dt. 30-4-63
18. Notification No. M.IT-152(33) |60 dt.
Foot Note : 24-9-63
yThe principal rule was amended earlier. A list of 19. NOtllﬁcatl'Ol‘l No. 1(26)|66-M-VI dt. 4-3-67
such amending notifications is as follows :— 20.  Notification No. 7(4)[85-M.VT dt. 22-9-86
21.  Notification No, 7(1)]|86-M.VI dt. 10-2-87
THE LIST 22.  Notification No. 19(9)[86-M.VT dt. 14-10-87
1. Notification No. 1|34|71-M.6 dt. 21-5-73 23. Notification No, 6(3)|87-M.VTI dt. 21-12-87
2. Notification No, M.II-152(37)]62 dt. 22-7-63 24.  Nctification No. 7(2)87-M.V.I dt. 13-4-88
3. Notification No. 1(34) |68-M.II dt. 23-5-70 25. Notification No. 7(1)|89-M.VI dt. 19-10-89

Printed by the Manager, Govt. oE Jndia Press, Ring Road, New DclhillOOfH
and Published by the Controllor of Publications, Delhi-110054, 1991




