
REGISTERED NO. D (D.N. ) 127

The Gazette of India
EXTRAORDINARY

PART II—Section 3—Sub-section (i)

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

No. 94) NEW DELHI, MONDAY, MARCH 11, 1991/PHALGUNA 20, 1912

Separate Paging is given to this Part in order that it may be filed as a
separate compilation

(1)684 GI/91



2 THE GAZETTE OF TNDTA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—5F.C. 3(i)]



3



4 THE GAZETTE OF IKDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(1)]



5



6 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA .EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

MINISTRY OF STEEL AND MINES

(Khan Vibhag)

NOTIFICATION

New Delhi, the 20th February, 1991

G.S.R. 129(E).—In exercise of the powers con-
ferred by section 13 of the Mines and Minerals (Re-
gulation and Development) Act, 1957 (67 of 1957),
the Central Government hereby makes the following
rules further to amend the Mineral Concession Rules,
1960, namely :—

1. (1) These rules may be called the Mineral Con-
cession (Amendment) Rules, 1990.

(2) They shall cere into force on the date of their
publication in the official Gazette.

2, In the Mineral Concession Rules, 1960,—

(1) In rule 9, in sub-rule (2) ,—

(i) in clause (d), after the proviso, the follow-
ing proviso shall be added, namely:—

"Provided further that in case the applicant
is a partnership firm or a private limited
company such certificate shall be furnisn-
ed by all partners of the partnership firm
or, as the case may be, all members of
the private limited company";

(ii) for clause (g), the following clause shall be
substituted, namely :—

"(g) a statement in writing that the applicant,
where the land is not owned by him, has
obtained surface rights over the area or
has obtained the consent of the uwiier
for starting prospecting operations :

Provided that no such statement shall be neces-
sary where the land is owned by the
Government;



7

Provided further that the consent of the owner
for starting prospecting operations in the
area or part thereof may be furnished
after execution of the prospecting licence
but before entry into the said area.";

(2) Rule 10 A shall be omitted;
(3) In rule 11, in sub-rule (1), for the words

"twelve months" the words "two years" shall be sub-
stituted;

(4) In rule 13, sub-rules (2) and (3) shall be omit-
ted;

(5) After rule 13, the following rule shall be in-
serted, namely :—

"13 A. Status of erant on death of the applicant
for prospecting licence.—(1) Where an
applicant for the grant of a orqspecting
licence dies before the order granting him
a prospecting licence is pasced. the applicant
for the grant of a prospecting licence shall
be deemed to have been made by his legal
representative.

(2) In the case of an applicant in respect of
whom an order granting a prospecting
licence is passed but who dies before the
deed referred to in sub-rule (1) of rule 15
is executed, the order shaft be deemed to
have been passed in the name of the legal
representative of the deceased."

(6) In rule 14. in sub-rule (1), in clause (ii), after
the proviso, the following proviso shall be added,
namely:—

"Provided further that if any quantity in excess
of the quantities specified in sub-clause (b)
and sub-clause (c) of the proviso is won
and carried away, the State Government
may recover the cost of the excess quantity
of minerals won and carried away.";

(7) In rule 22. in sub-rule (3), in clause (i),—

(i) to sub-clu<?e (d), the following proviso shall
be added, namely :—

"Provided that in case the applicant is a part-
nership firm or a private limited com-
pany., such certificate shall be furnished
by all partners of the partnership firm or,
as the case may be, all members of the
private limited company.";

'Ii) in sub.-clause <e), after the words "Central
Government" the words "or duly authorised
officer" shall be inserted.

(iii) for sub-clause (h), the following sub-clause
shall be substituted, namely :—

"(h) a statement in writing that the applicant
has, where the land n's not owned by him,
obtained surface rihgts over the area or
has obtained the consent of the owner
for starting mining operations :

Provided that no such statement: shall be
necessary where the land is owned by the
Government;

Provided further that the consent of the owner
for starting mining operations in the area
or part thereof may be furnished after
execution of the lease deed but before
entry into the said afea '•

Provided alos that no further consent would
be required in the case of renewal where
consent has already been obtained duiing
grant of the lease;";

(8) In rule 22 B, in sub-rule (1) after the words
"Central Government" the words "or duly authorised
officer" shall be inserted.

(9) In rule 22 BB,—

(i) in sub-rule (1), for the words "approval to
the authority" the words "approval through
the authority" shall be substiuted:

(i;) in sub-rule (2), for the words "Any person",
the words "Notwithstanding the provisions
of rule 54, any person" shall be substituted :

(10) In rule 24,—

(i) in sub-rule (1), for the words, "twelve
mont hs". the words "two years" shall be
substituted;

(ii) in sub-rnle (6). for the words, "twelve
months" the words "two years" shall be
substituted;

HI) Tn rule 24A, in sub-rule (6). for the words
"Tf an aPDbVantion for first renewal", the words
"Notwithstanding the p^ovisons, of sub-rule (5), if an
application for renewal" shall be substituted;

(12) After rule 25, the following rule shall be
insered, namely :—

"25A. Status of the grant on the d?ath of appli-
cant for mining lea^e.—(I) Wher° an ap-
plicant for grant or renewal of mmms lease
'l;e<: before the order granting him a m;n;ne
lease or its renewal is ©assed. the applica-
tion for the fjrant or renewal of a mining
1ea«<» shall be deemed to have been made
bv hi<: legal representative.

f?) In the ca*e of an applicant 'in respect of
whom an order prinf-Vig or renewing a min-
inff ler̂ f" 'is Passed, but who d<>s b"iro^ tV
deed referred to in «ub-ru1e (\) of rule 31
is executed, the order shall be deemed1 to
have been passed in the name of the Ic^al
representative of the deceased.";

H3> (Tn rule 26. in sub-rule (31. for the wortfs
'thjrtv days', the words "sixty days" shall be sub-
stituted;

(14) Tn rule 27,—

(i) in sub-rule OV for clause fti). the following-
clause shall be substituted, namelv :—

"(n) +he lessee shall store pronerV the unuti-
lized or n on -saleable sub-evade ores or
minerals for future benefidation";



8 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART TT—SEC. 3(i)]

(ii) for sub-rule (5), the following sub-rule shall
be substituted, namely :—.

"(5) If the lessee makes any default in the
payment of royalty as required under
section 9 or payment of dead rent as re-
quired under section 9A or com-
mits a breach of any of the con-
ditions specified in sub-rules (1), (2)
and (3), except the condition refer-
red to in clause (f) of sub-rule (1), the
State Government shall give not;ce to the
lessee requiring him to pay the royalty
or dead rent or remedy the breach, as
the case may be, within sixty da^s from
the date of the receipt of the notice and
if the royalty or dead rent is not paid or
the breach is not remedied within the said
period, the State Government may, with-
out prejudice to any other proceedings
that may be taken against him, determine
the lease and forfeit the whole or part of
the security deposit.";

(15) In rule 28, for the Explanation, the following
Explanations shall be sub-iiluted, namely: ~

"Explanat'on 1 : Where the non-commencement
of the mining operations within a period of
one vear from the date of execution of min-
ing lease is on account of —

(a) delay in acquisition of surface rights; or

(tO delay in getting the possession of the leased
area; or

(c) delay in supply or installation of machi-
nery; or

(d) delay in getting financial assistance from
banks, or any financial institutions; or

(e) ensuring supolv of the mineral in an in-.
dustry of which the lessee is the owner
or in which he holds not less than 50
per cent of the controlling interest'

and the lessee is able to furnsh documentary evidence
supported by a duiv sworn affidavit, the State Gov-
ernment mav consider if there are sufficient reasons
for non-commencement of operations for a continu-
ous period of more than one year.

Explanation 2 : Where the discontinuance of
min<* ooerat'ons for a continuous period of
one vear after the commencement of such
operations is an account of :•—

(a) orders passed by any statutory or judicial
authority; or

(b) ^Derations becoming h'ghly uneconomi-
cal; or

(c) Strike or lock out;

and the lessee is able to -furnish documentary evidence
supported1 bv n dniv sworn affidavit, the State Gov-
ernment mav consider if there are sirfTdent reasons
for discontinuance of operations" for a cont'nuous
period of more than one year.";

(16) After rule 28, the following rule shall be in-
serted, namely :—

"28A. (1) Where a lessee is unable to commence
the mining operations within a period of
one year from the date of execution of the
miriing lease, or discontinues mining opera-
tions for a period of exceeding one year for
reasons beyond his control, he mav submit
an application to the State Government ex-
plaining the reasons for the same at least
within six months from the date of its lapse:

Provided that the lease has not been re-
vived under this provision for more than
twice during the entire period of the lease.

(2) Every application under sub-rule (1)
shall be accompanied by a fee of Rs. 500|-

(3) The State Government on receipt of
an application made under sub-rule (1) and
on being satisfied about the adequacy and
genuineness of the reasons for non-com-
mencement of mining operations or discon-
tinuance thereof takintz not consideration the
matters specified in the Exolanation to rule
28. pass an order reviving the lease.";

(17) Tn rule 29.

(i) in sub-rule (1), —

(a) clause (c) .in the second proviso shall be
omitted;

(b) after the second proviso, the following
proviso shall be inserted, namely : —

"Provided also that surrender of the lease areal
by the lessee shall be permitted onlv thrice
during the period of the lease on fulfilling
the conditions —

('i) that atleast a period of five years has
elapsed since the last surrender; and

(ii) that the provisions of the mining plant
including the environment management
plan thereof have been complied with.";

(ii) after sub-rule (2), the following sub-rule
shall be inserted namely:—

"(3> Every application for the surrender of
a part of the lease-hold area shall be dis1-
posed of within twelve months from the
date of its receipt and, if it is not so dis-
posed of within that period, 1't shall be
deemed to have been refused.";

(18) Tn rule 35, for the WOT^S "held under mining
lease" the words "of a mining lease" shall be substi-
tuted;

(19) In rule 3 7 , —

(0 in sub-rule (1), after the words "the State
Govt." thewords "and in the case of min-
ing lease in respect of any mineral speci-
fied in the IPirst Schedule to the Act. with-
out the previous approval of the Central
Government" shall be inserted;



9

(ii) in sub-rule (1A), for clause (a), the follow-
ing clause shall be substituted, namely :—

"(a) prepare a mining plan and programme
of extration duly approved by an autho-
rity appointed by the Central Govern-
ment tin cases where such a plan and pro-
gramme has not been already appdoved
by the competent authority and also
agrees to undertake mining operations in
accordance with the approved mining
pain;";

(20) ,In rule 42, fod sub-rule (2) the following sub-
rule shall be substituted, namely :—

"(2) Except with the previous approval of the
Central Government, no prospecting licence
or mining lease shall be granted in res-
pect of any mineral specified in the First
Schedule to the Act.";

(21) In rule 45, after clause (i), the following
clause shall be inserted, namely:—

"(ia) miming operations shall be undertaken in
accordance with the duly approved fining
plan;";

(22) In rule 54, in Explanation, after the words
"for transfer", the words "for surrender" .'hall be
inserted;

(23) In rule 55, for sub-rules (1) and (2) rhe
following sub-rules shall be substituted, namely:—

"(1) On receipt of an application for revision
under rule 54, copies thereof shall be sent
to the State Govt. or other authority and to
all the impleaded parties calling upon them
to make such comments as they may like
to make within three months from the date
of issue of the communfeation, and the State
Government or other authority and the im-
plcaded parties, whils furnishing comments
to the Central Government shall simultane-
ously endorse a copy of the comments to
the other parties :

Provided that in the case of deemed re-
fusal, the Central Government may pass
such order in relation thereto, as it may
deem appropriate.

(2) Comments received from any party under
sulwule (1) shall be sent to the other parties
for' making such further comments as they
may like to make within one month from
the date of issue oF thc i.'ommi'iicntion and
the parties making further rommyits sh:iJ!
send them to all the other parties."',

24) In rule 59, ia sub-rule (1),—

(i) clause fb) shall be omitted;

(ii) the following clause shall be inserted after
clause (e), namely :—

"(f) which has been reserved by the Govern-
ment or any local authority for any pur-
pose other than mining";

(iii) the following proviso shall be inserted after
the second proviso under sub-clause (ii),
namely:—

"Provided al?o that where an area held under
prospecting licence is granted in terms of
sub-section (1) of section 11, no notirica-
cation under clause (ii) shall be required
to be issued.";

(25) In rule 64A, for the words "fifteen per cent"
the words "twenty four per cent" shall be substituted;

(26) Tn Schedule .1, —

(A) la Form I, in paragraph 3, for the entry
(xviii), the follow,ing entry shall be substi-
tuted, namely :—

"faviii) A report giving the details of prospect-
ling carried out in the area together with
assessment of the ore reserves, ecological
plans, results of chemical analysis of the
representative samples, and boreholes and
logs.";

(B) in Form K,—

(i) Tn Part VI, in paragraph 3, for the words
"fifteen per cent" the words "twenty-
four per cent" shall be substituted;

(ii) in Part VII, in paragraph 1 IB, for the
words and figure "Mines Act, 1952" the
words and figures "Mines Act, 1952 and
the rules made thereunder" shall be sub-
stituted;

(iii) in Part Vjf/f, in paragraph 3,—

(a) for the portion beginning with the
words "where the mining lease" and
ending with the words "option of the
Icsseejicssees;" the following shall bo
substituted namely:—

"The miming lease is renewable in terms ot
the provisistions of the Acr and rha
rules made thereunder.";

(b) for the words and figure with letter, "in
accordance with rule 24A of the said
rule ;̂", the following words shall be sub-
stituted, namely:—

"in accordance with th; provisions of the
Act and the rules made thereunder";

(c) in Form 'N\ for items 3. 4 and 4A the
following items shall be substituted
namely:—

"3. (a) Number and date of order and
authority ^assint; the order against

which revision application is filed;

(b) Date of communications of the order
to the applicant,

4. (a) If the application is in respect of deemed
rejection, the date of receipt of the application for
mineral concession, surrender or transfer by the State
Govt.;684 GT(91—



10 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

(b) If the aipplcation is lin respect of an order made
on an application for mineral concession, specify —

(i) whether for grant or renewal;

(,ii) whether for prospecting licence or for min-
ling lease;

(iii) date of such application;

(iv) if for renewal, the number and date of letter
of the State Government conveying the
grant and the date upto which licenceflease
was granted;

(v) in the case of second or subsequent renewal,
the number and date of letter of earlier
grant(s) and date(s) upto which grant(s)
have been made.".

p i e No. 7(l)|90-M.VI]
SURENDRA MISHRA, Jt. Secy.

Foot Note:

>The principal rule was amended earlier. A list of
such amending notifications is as follows :—

THE LIST

1. Notification No. 1|34|71-M.6 dt. 21-5-73
2. Notification No. M,II-152(37)|62 dt. 22-7-63
3. Notification No. 1(34) |68-M.ll dt. 23-5-70

4. Notification No. 1(26)|71-M.VI dt- 14-2-72
5. Notification No. 1(2)168-M.;II dt. 23-2-68
6. Notification No. 1(3)|68-M.II dt. 30-3-68
7. Notification No. M.IM69(44)|61 dt.7-9-61
8. Notification No. 1(22)|62-M.II dt. 18-7-63
9. Notification No. 1(74)|75-M.VI dt. 2-5-79

10. Notification No. 1(3)|68-M.VI dt. 17-1-68
11. Notification No. 1(33)|67-M.VI (Vol.11)

dt. 22-7-71
12. Notification No. M.IT-169 (44) |61 dt. 6-9-63
13. Notification No, 1(3)|7l-M.VI dt. 6-9-71
14. Notification No. 1(51)|65-M.II dt. 26-2-69
15. Notification No. M.II-152(11[62 dt. 6-5-63
16. Notification No. 3(5l)|74-M.Vl dt. 16-1-80
17. Notification No. M. IT-152(58)6l dt. 30-4-63
18. Notification No. M,IT-152(33)|6O dt.

24-9-63
19. Notification No. 1(26)|66-M-VI dt. 4-3-67
20. Notification No. 7(4)|85-M.Vl dt. 22-9-86
21. Notification No. 7(1)|86-M.VT dt. 10-2-87
22. Notification No. 19(9)|86-M.VI dt. 14-10-87
23. Notification No. 6l3)|87-M.VI dt. 21-12-87
24. Notification No. 7(2>|87-M.V.T dt. 13-4-88
25. Notification No. 7(1) (89-M.VJI dt. 19-10-89

Printed by th<: Manager, Govt. o£ Jndia Pre««, Ring Road, New Delhi-HOOfH
and Published by tlie Controller oi Publications, Delhi-110054, 1991


