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| Governnent of India
Ministry of Potroleun & Chemicals and Mlnes & Metals
(DEP ARTMENT OF MINES ZND METALS)

. *. .

NEW DELHI, THE 23RD MAY,1970
2 JYLLoT A, 1892
_ NOTIF I CALLEON
G;S.B___. l \ |7 o= In exercise of the powers conferred by section 13 of
the Mines and Minerals (Regilation and Development ) Act, 1957 L 67 oF
1957), the Central Government her eby makes the follbwing rales

further te amend the Mineral Concession Rules, 1960 namelys:=.

Le /1) ™ase riles nay be called the Mineral Conce ssion ('*Second
AanGrony RaLe s; 1070 .
(2) Thov shall come into force on the date of thelr publicar *
tion in the O0fficigl Gazette. : ;
Da In the Minersl Concession Rules, 1060, = ‘

(1) in rule 9, = :
(i) in suberule (2), a-fter clause (c), the following

clause shall be inserted, namely:- :
n(d) a valid clearance certificate, in the form prescrib-
ed by the State Government, of payment of mining dues,

such as royalty or dead rcnt and surface rent payable
under the Act or the rules made thereunder, from that

Government or any officer or authority anthorised by
_that Government in. this behalf:
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Provided thal shere eny injunction has -been
N

| igsued by a court of law or any other compe:‘t:ent arthority

" staying the recovery of any such mining dues, the none '

- payment thereof shzll not be treated as a d: squalifieation
for the purpose of gr-nting or rencwlng the sald '
prospecting llicences

provided further that vhere a percon has
furnished an 'ai'fide:vit to the satisfaction of the State
Government shating that he does not hold a DIo Spec’icing
licence, it shall not be necessary for him to produée' the
sald valid clecarance certificate."; :

(11) after submrule (2), the following sub=rules

eligll be inserted, namelyse

3y Tho Gbate Government may, for reasons to

be recorded In wrliting, relax the provisioiis
1 of cirude () of sub-rule (2) of mla O, |

¢ Enh T (4) ‘e grant of a clearance certificate

| under clanszse (d) of subwrule (2) .of mle e \\

chall not disciarge the holder ¢Z such

certificate from the 11ability To pay the

mining dues vhich may sub seque.ﬁtly be found To

(1) in clamse_(i);* afhor subeclause (c), The
following sub-clause shall be inserted, namelyg-é-_r
u(d) a valid clearanco certificate, ’n the Torn
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prescribed by the State Gox}ernment s O payment

of mining dues, such as royalty or dead rent

and surface rent payable under the Act or the
rules made thereunder, from tkat Government or
any officer or authority authori sed by that

Government in this behalfs:

Provided that where any injunction has been
issued by a court of law or any other competent authority
staying the recovery of any such- mining dﬁes,‘ ‘the non-
Payment thereof shall not be treated as a ‘d"’.squalificafion
for the 'puriaose of granting or renewing the said mining
leases ' | '

Provided further that where a person has
furnished an affidavit to the satisfaction of the State
Govermment stating that he‘does not hold a mirﬁﬁg leasea, .
1T shall not be necessary for him to produce the said
valid clearance certificates

Provided also that the erant ‘of a ¢learance
certificate under sub-clause (d) shall not discharge the
nolder of such certificate from the 1liability to pay the
mining dues which 'may subseqguently be found to be payable

by nim under the Act or t'he rules made thereunder, "3

‘ (11) after clause (i) , the following clause
snall be inserwed, namelys=

- "™ia) The State Government may, .for reasons
to be recorded in writing, relax the provision
of sub-clause (d) of elause (i)éhﬂ; ' :
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Provided that where any injunction has-been

: issued by a court of law or any other COmpe tent anthority

" staying the recovery of any suich mining dues, the nons |

- payment thereof shsll not be treated as a 42 squalifieation
for the purpose of gr-nting or rencwing the saild '

prospecting llcences

provi ded purther that vhere a percon has

Purnished an af fidavit to the satisfaction of the State

Government siating that he does not hold a prosSpE cﬁng
licence, it ghall not be necessaly for him to produce the

said valild ciecarance ge*rtlflca'te-"; :
(i1) after suberule (2), the following sub=rules
eliall be insertedy namelyse

oy T te Government may, for reasons t

W~ ) ) 1 .44,,.4
be rcecorded In writing, relax the provisioins
: s Y o mbrile (R OF REL B
ot Y. The grant of a clearance certificate

ander olaise (a).of sub=ruls (2) of mle 9 \\

chall not disciarge the holder ¢f such
cartificate from the 1igbility to p.ay the
mining dues which may sub secme.ﬁtly be found to
bee payable by him under the Act or the rules

made therounder.™s | i

-~

(2) in rule 82, in sub-rule (3)y
(1) in clause (1)y alter subeclemse (c), the '

following sub=claunse shall be inserted, namalyse
u(g) g valid clearanco certificate, in the foIm
- " "“’;_‘1-..'3/;.'*"’ :
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prescribed by the State Gow}ernment s Of payment

of mining dues, such as royalty or dead rent

and surface rent payable under the Act or the
rules made thereunder, from that Government or
any officer or authority aut horised by that

Government in this behalf:

Provided that where any injunciion has been
issued by a court of law or any other competent authority
staying the recovery of any such' minirig dﬁ955 ‘the none
payment thereof shall not be treated as a "dérsqualificafion
for the 'puri)ose of granting or renewing the said mining
leases : |

Provided further that whercec a person has
fournished an affidavit to the satisfaction of the State
Govermment stating that he‘does not hold a mihir;g lease,.
1t shall not be necessary for him to produce the said
valid clearance certificate:

Provided also that the erant ‘of a ¢learance
certificate under sub-clause (d) shall not discharge the
nolder of such certificate from the 1iébility t6 pay the
mining dues which may subsequently be found to be payable
by nim under the Aect or t'he rules made thereunder, s
(11) after clause (i), the following clause

shall be inserved, namelys-

"(ia) The State Government may, for reasons

to be recorded in writing, relax the provision
of sub-clause (d) of elause (i). "
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(3) -in Schedule I, -

(i) in Form B, after item (vi) of.para 3, the
following items shall be inserted, namelys-
"(via) No, and date of the valid clearance
certificate of payment of mining dues (copy
attached), -

«.+. (vib) If on the date of application the
applicant -does not hold a prospecting licence,
it should be stated whether an affidavit to

. ~this effect has been furnished to the

' . satisfaction of the State Government.";

-.(11) in Form E, after item (vi) of para 2, tne
following item shall be inserted, namely:-
"(via) No. and date of the valid clearance

:certificate of payment of mining dues (copy

'}Lenclbsed).";_ _

. (111) in Form I, after item (vi) of para 3, the

- folilowing items shall be inserted, namelys:-
"(via) Noe and date of the vglid clearance:
- certificate off payment of mining dues CCOpy;
enclosed). e
(vib) If on the date of epplication, tThe
applicent does not hold a mining lease, 1%
should be stated whether an affidavit To This
effect nas been furnished to the satisfaction

of the State Government.™:
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(1v§ in Form J, after item (vi) of para 2,4 the
fog.lowing item shall be inscrted. namely:-
t(via) No. and date of the valid clearance
certificate of payment of mining dues (copy

enclosed).".
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( A. SETHUMADHAVAN)
Under Secretary to the Government of India.

To

The General Manager,
Governnient of India Press,
Minto RO&d,

NEW DaLHIS
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